
561

BY AUTHORITY

NO. 150	 Tuesday 28th October 	 2025

EXTRA-ORDINARY GAZETTE
LEGAL NOTICE

The following are published as a Supplement to this Gazette: 
[Legal Notice Nos. 431 to 433]



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the  

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Copier World Ltd



603

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Tuesday 28th October, 2025	 S.I. No. 75

[Legal Notice No. 431]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025

Table of provisions
1	 Citation............................................................................................................. 603
2	 Commencement................................................................................................ 603
3	 Amendment of Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service)  

(Chief Justice) Regulations 2015..................................................................... 603
4	 Regulation 7 amended...................................................................................... 603
5	 New regulation 28B inserted............................................................................ 604
6	 Regulation 31 amended.................................................................................... 604
7	 Schedule deleted and substituted...................................................................... 604

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS  
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS  2025

I, Hon. Jeremiah Manele, Prime Minister, under section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), make the following Regulations:

1 	 Citation
These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms and 
Conditions of Service) (Chief Justice) (Amendment) Regulations 2025.

2	  Commencement
These Regulations commence on the date these Regulations are published in 
the Gazette.

3 	 Amendment of Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) 
(Chief Justice) Regulations 2015
These Regulations amend the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
of Service) (Chief Justice) Regulations 2015 (Legal Notice No. 72 of 2015) 
(“Principal Regulations”).

4	  Regulation 7 amended
Regulation 7(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting



604
“4 years” and substituting “1 year”.

5	  New regulation 28B inserted
The Principal Regulations is amended by inserting the following after 
regulation 28A:

“28B Retirement benefits

(1) A retired Chief Justice is entitled to:

(a) a housing allowance equal to 60% of the housing allowance applicable
at the time of retirement;

(b) a vehicle provided by the Government, and the Government is responsible
for all costs of repair and maintenance, except for the cost of fuel.

(2) The surviving spouse of a retired Chief Justice is entitled to a housing
allowance equal to 20% of the housing allowance payable to the retired Chief
Justice at the time of his or her death.

(3) The housing allowance of the surviving spouse in subregulation (2) ends, if
the surviving spouse remarries or dies.

(4) The vehicle benefit of the retired Chief Justice in subregulation (1)(b) ends at
the time of his or her death.”.

6 Regulation 31 amended
Regulation 31 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “annually”
and substituting “every 3 years”.

7 Schedule deleted and substituted
The Principal Regulations is amended by deleting the Schedule and
substituting the following:

“SCHEDULE	  AMOUNTS PAYABLE TO CHIEF JUSTICE
(Regulation 30)

Regulation Description Amount
5 Fortnightly  salary $14,834.77
7 Monthly housing allowance $20,000
9 Monthly utilities allowance $8,000
11 Monthly vehicle allowance $7,000
11 Monthly fuel allowance $5,000
15 Daily overseas travel allowance US$450
17 Daily local travel allowance $600
18 Annual clothing allowance $15,000
20 Annual entertainment allowance $14,000
20A Annual medical expenses allowance $15,000



605
23 Annual education allowance  $22,000
24 Daily higher duties allowance  $100
25 Appointment grant $14,400
28 Termination grant $480,000
34 Mobile handset allowance (every 3 years)  $7,000
34 Monthly telephone allowance $4,000”.

Made this twenty-fourth day of October 2025.

HON. JEREMIAH MANELE
PRIME MINISTER

[Legal Notice No. 432]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(DEPUTY CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025

Table of provisions
1	 Citation............................................................................................................. 605
2	 Commencement................................................................................................ 605
3	 Amendment of Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) 

(Deputy Chief Justice) Regulations 2015......................................................... 606
4	 Regulation 7 amended...................................................................................... 606
5	 New regulations 28A and 28B inserted............................................................ 606
6	 Regulation 31 amended.................................................................................... 606
7	 Schedule deleted and substituted...................................................................... 606

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

 (Cap. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(DEPUTY CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025

I, Hon. Jeremiah Manele, Prime Minister, under section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), make these Regulations:

1 Citation
These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms and 
Conditions of Service) (Deputy Chief Justice) (Amendment) Regulations 
2025.

2 Commencement
These Regulations commence on the date these Regulations are published in 
the Gazette.



606
3 Amendment of Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) 

(Deputy Chief Justice) Regulations 2015 
These Regulations amend the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
of Service) (Deputy Chief Justice) Regulations 2015 (Legal Notice No. 73 of 
2015) (“Principal Regulations”).

4 Regulation 7 amended
Regulation 7(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “4 years” 
and substituting “1 year”.

5 New regulations 28A and 28B inserted
The Principal Regulations is amended by inserting the following after 
regulation 28:

“28A Pension scheme

(1) A retired Deputy Chief Justice is entitled to an annual pension equal to 40%
of the annual salary applicable at the time of retirement.

(2) The surviving spouse of a retired Deputy Chief Justice is entitled to a pension
equal to 20% of the pension payable to the retired Deputy Chief Justice at the
time of his or her death.

(3) The pension of the surviving spouse in subregulation (2) ends, if the surviving
spouse remarries or dies.
28B Housing allowance for retired Deputy Chief Justice

(1) A retired Deputy Chief Justice is entitled to a housing allowance equal to 60%
of the housing allowance applicable at the time of retirement.

(2) The surviving spouse of a retired Deputy Chief Justice is entitled to a housing
allowance equal to 20% of the housing allowance payable to the retired
Deputy Chief Justice at the time of his or her death.

(3) The housing allowance of the surviving spouse in subregulation (2) ends, if
the surviving spouse remarries or dies.”.

6 Regulation 31 amended
Regulation 31 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “annually”
and substituting “every 3 years”.

7	 Schedule deleted and substituted
The Principal Regulations is amended by deleting the Schedule and
substituting the following:

“SCHEDULE AMOUNTS PAYABLE TO DEPUTY CHIEF JUSTICE

(Regulation 30)



607
Regulation Description  Amount

5 Fortnightly salary $13,351.29
7 Monthly housing allowance $19,000.00
9 Monthly utilities allowance $7,200.00
11 Monthly vehicle allowance $6,500.00
11 Monthly fuel allowance $4,600.00
15  Daily overseas travel allowance  US$400.00
17 Daily local travel allowance $550.00
18 Annual clothing allowance $14,000.00
20 Annual entertainment allowance $13,000.00

20A Annual medical expenses allowance $15,000.00
23 Annual education allowance $21,000.00
24 Daily higher duties allowance $100.00
25  Appointment grant $13,200.00
28 Termination grant $440,000.00
34 Mobile	handset	allowance	(every	3	years)  $6,500.00
34 Monthly telephone allowance  $3,500.00”.

Made this twenty-fourth day of October 2025.

HON. JEREMIAH MANELE
PRIME MINISTER

[Legal Notice No. 433]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(PUISNE  JUDGES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025

Table of provisions
1	 Citation............................................................................................................. 608
2	 Commencement................................................................................................ 608
3	 Amendment of Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) 

(Puisne Judges) Regulations 2015................................................................... 608
4	 Regulation 7 amended...................................................................................... 608
5	 New regulations 28A and 28B inserted............................................................ 608
6	 Regulation 31 amended.................................................................................... 608
7	 Schedule deleted and substituted...................................................................... 609

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

 (Cap. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(PUISNE JUDGES (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025

I, Hon. Jeremiah Manele, Prime Minister, under section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 



608
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), make these Regulations:

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

Citation
These	 Regulations	may	 be	 cited	 as	 the	Constitutional Offices (Terms and 
Conditions of Service) (Puisne Judges) (Amendment) Regulations 2025.

Commencement
These	Regulations	commence	on	the	date	these	Regulations	are	published	in	
the Gazette.

Amendment of Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) 
(Puisne Judges) Regulations 2015 
These	Regulations	amend	the	Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
of Service) (Puisne Judges) Regulations 2015	(Legal	Notice	No.	74	of	2015)	
(“Principal Regulations”).

Regulation 7 amended
Regulation	7(2)	of	the	Principal	Regulations	is	amended	by	deleting	“4	years”	
and	substituting	“1	year”.

New regulations 28A and 28B inserted
The	 Principal	 Regulations	 is	 amended	 by	 inserting	 the	 following	 after	
regulation	28:

“28A Pension scheme

(1) A retired Puisne Judge is entitled to an annual pension equal to 30% of the
annual salary applicable at the time of retirement.

(2) The surviving spouse of a retired Puisne Judge is entitled to a pension equal
to 20% of the pension payable to the retired Puisne Judge  at the time of his
or her death.

(3) The pension of the surviving spouse in subregulation (2) ends, if the surviving
spouse remarries or dies.
28B Housing allowance for retired Puisne Judge

(1) A retired Puisne Judge is entitled to a housing allowance equal to 60% of the
housing allowance applicable at the time of retirement.

(2) The surviving spouse of a retired Puisne Judge is entitled to a housing
allowance equal to 20% of the housing allowance payable to the retired
Puisne Judge at the time of his or her death.

(3) The entitlement of the surviving spouse to receive the housing allowance
under subregulation (2) ends, if the surviving spouse remarries or dies.”.

6 Regulation 31 amended



609
Regulation 31 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “annually” 
and substituting “every 3 years”.

7	 Schedule deleted and substituted
The Principal Regulations is amended by deleting the Schedule and 
substituting the following:

“SCHEDULE AMOUNTS PAYABLE TO PUISNE JUDGE

(Regulation 30)

Regulation Description  Amount
5 Fortnightly salary $12,016.00
7 Monthly housing allowance $18,000.00
9 Monthly utilities allowance $6,400.00
11 Monthly vehicle allowance $6,000.00
11 Monthly fuel allowance $4,600.00
15  Daily overseas travel allowance  US$350.00
17 Daily local travel allowance $500.00
18 Annual clothing allowance $13,000.00
20 Annual entertainment allowance $12,000.00

20A Annual medical expenses allowance $15,000.00
23 Annual education allowance $20,000.00
24 Daily higher duties allowance $100.00
25 Appointment grant $13,200.00
28 Termination grant $400,000.00
34 Mobile	handset	allowance	(every 3	years) $6,000.00
34 Monthly telephone allowance $3,000.00”.

Made this twenty-fourth day of October 2025.

HON. JEREMIAH MANELE
PRIME MINISTER



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the  

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Copier World Limited


	NO. 150 Tuesday 28th October 2025
	The following are published as a Supplement to this Gazette:[Legal Notice Nos. 431 to 433]
	S.I. No. 75 Tuesday 28th October, 2025 
	[Legal Notice No. 431]CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)(CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025
	[Legal Notice No. 432]CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)(DEPUTY CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025
	[Legal Notice No. 433]CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)(PUISNE JUDGES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025








