148

S U P P LEM EN T to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Friday 251 May, 2018 S.I. No. 37

[Legal Notice No. 47]

CUSTOMARY LAND RECORDS (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2018

Table of provisions

1 Citation 1
2 Commencement 1



149

CUSTOMARY LAND RECORDS (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2018

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 21 of the Customary Land Records
Act (Cap. 132, the Minister for Lands, Housing and Survey, makes the following
Regulations:

1

Citation

These Regulations may be cited as the Customary Land Records
(Amendment) Regulations 2018.

Commencement
These Regulations commence on the date of publication in the Gazette.
Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4(3) of the Principal is amended by deleting “three (3) months”
and substituting “one (1) month”.

Regulation 9 amended

(a) Regulation 9(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “six months” and substituting “one month”; and

(b) Regulation 9(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “six months” and substituting “one month”.

MADE IN HONIARA this twentieth-third day of May, 2018.

HON. ANDREW MANEPORA’A
Minister for Lands, Housing and Survey

Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Pacific Printers Limited.



